2025-2026 Summation of all R & B Material Bids

CONTRACT YEAR: MAY 1, 2025 THROUGH APRIL 30, 2026
Item Bid:

Lowest Bidder

Crushed Rock 3/4"-Pct. 1 & Pct. 4 Only Delivered Woodrum Construction
Crushed Rock 3/4"-Pct. 2 & Pct. 3 Only Delivered 4M Truck Trailer & Equip
Crushed Rock 3/4" Undelivered No Bidders

Crushed Rock 1" or less - All Delivered Woodrum Construction
Crushed Rock 1" or less Undelivered No Bidders

Crushed Rock 1 3/4" or less- "FLEX" BASE- Pct. 1 & Pct. 4 Only Delivered Woodrum Construction
Crushed Rock 1 3/4" or less- "FLEX" BASE- Pct. 2 & Pct. 3 Only Delivered 4M Truck Trailer & Equip
Crushed Rock 1 3/4" or less- "FLEX" BASE-ALL Pct's Undelivered No Bidders

Crushed Rock 1 3/4" or less- "STATE" BASE-ALL Pct's Delivered Woodrum Construction
Crushed Rock 1 3/4" or less- "STATE" BASE-ALL Pct's Undelivered No Bidders

Haul Only - Arcosa-Lester Pit- Pct. 1, Pct. 2, & Pct. 4 Only

Haul Only Rock

Woodrum Construction

Haul Only - Arcosa-Lester Pit-  Pct. 3 Only Haul Only Rock |4M Truck Trailer & Equip

Road Oil Dellve.red & Bryan & Bryan Asphalt
Undelivered

Raw/Unrefined Crude Oil Del./Undel. No Bidders

Railroad Tank Cars Delivered The Railroad Yard

Pea Gravel Washed 3/8 "-Pct. 1, Pct. 3 & Pct. 4 Only Delivered Woodrum Construction

Pea Gravel Washed 3/8 "-Pct. 2 ONLY Delivered 4M Truck Trailer & Equip

Pea Gravel Washed 3/8 " Undelivered No Bidders

Qil Sand- All Pct's Delivered Longview Asphalt

Qil Sand -Pct. 3 Only (same price for Pct. 3 as Longview Asphalt) Delivered Texas Materials

Oil Sand - no bid Pct. 2 Undelivered Texas Materials

Type D Hot Mix- Pct. 1, Pct. 2, & Pct. 3 Only Delivered Austin Asphalt

Type D Hot Mix- Pct. 4 Only Delivered Texas Materials

Type D Hot Mix Undelivered Austin Asphalt

Type B Hot Mix- Delivered Austin Asphalt

Type B Hot Mix- Undelivered Austin Asphalt

SSM-Pct. 1, Pct. 3, & Pct. 4 ONLY Delivered Texas Materials

SSM-Pct. 1, Pct. 3, & Pct. 4 ONLY Undelivered Texas Materials

ASPPM-Pct. 1, Pct. 3, & Pct. 4 ONLY Delivered Texas Materials

ASPPM-Pct. 1, Pct. 3, & Pct. 4 ONLY Undelivered Texas Materials

CPR-4-Pct. 1, Pct. 3, & Pct. 4 ONLY Delivered Texas Materials

CPR-4 Undelivered Texas Materials

Cold Mix Delivered Sustainable Pavement

Cold Mix Undelivered Sustainable Pavement

Cresote Lumber N/A No Bidders

14 Gauge Steel Culverts- 12"~72" Delivered Wilson Culverts

14 Gauge Steel Culverts- 12"~72" Undelivered Wilson Culverts

16 Gauge Steel Culverts - 12"~72" Delivered Wilson Culverts

16 Gauge Steel Culverts - 12"~72" Undelivered Wilson Culverts

Seal Coat AC-5 Chip Rock & Seal Coat AC-5 Pea Gravel Delivered D & M Contractors

Seal Coat AC-10 Chip Rock & Seal Coat AC-10 Pea Gravel Delivered D & M Contractors

Seal Coat MC 3000 Chip Rock & Seal Coat MC 3000 Pea Gravel Delivered D & M Contractors

Seal Coat CRS-2 Chip Rock & Seal Coat CRS-2 Pea Gravel Delivered Bar None Paving

Emulsion Delivered

Hot Mix Road Procedures-Option #1 & # 2 Only Delivered Texana Land & Asphalt

Hot Mix Road Procedures- Option # 3 Only Delivered Area Wide Paving

Recycled Crushed Concrete 1 1/4"-ALL Pct's Delivered Woodrum Construction

Recycled Crushed Concrete 1 1/4"-Pct. 2 Only (same $ as Woodrum for . L

pct. 2) Delivered Big City Crushed Concrete

Recycled Crushed Concrete 1 1/4" Undelivered Big City Crushed Concrete

Recycled Crushed Concrete 1 3/4" Delivered Woodrum Construction

Recycled Crushed Concrete 1 3/4" Undelivered No Bidders

Recyled Unused Asphalt Shingle Pavement-per Mile Delivered No Bidders

Recyled Unused Asphalt Shingle Pavement-per Yard Undelivered Sustainable Pavement




2025-2026 R & B Fuel: Contract Yr: June 1, 2025 through May 31, 2026

Delivered

Offen Petroleum

Super Unleaded
Regular Unleaded Delivered Offen Petroleum
# 2 Diesel Delivered Offen Petroleum




06/01/2025 ~ 05/31/2026

Bid Tabulations

Road and Bridge Fuel

2025-202

Item Bid: Super Unleaded

Del Price + |State
Bidder Brand Octane rate Whl Price|Markup tax tax Fed tax |[Notes
Offen Petroleum Truman Arnold 93 E 10 2.2799 |0.07 2.5499 |0.20 N/A
*Disqualified-did
Global Montello Global 93 E 10 2.7087 10.4211 3.1298 0.20 0.183 |not send invoice
or proof of cost
Borders & Long No Bid
Item Bid: Regular Unleaded
Offen Petroleum Valero Unbranded 87 E 10 1.9651 |0.07 2.2351 |0.20 N/A
*Disqualified-did
Global Montello Global 87 E 10 2.0320 ]0.2812 2.3132 [0.20 0.183 [not send invoice
or proof of cost
Borders & Long No Bid
Offen Petroleum | Fikes 87 Non-Ethonal | 2.2470 |0.07 2.5170 [0.20 N/A |*non bidded item
Item Bid: #2 Diesel
Offen Petroleum Fikes Ultra Low Non-BIO| 2.3815 |0.07 2.6515 [0.20 N/A
Borders & Long No Bid
*Disqualified-did
Global Montello Global ULSD #2 2.3094 10.3175 2.6269 0.20 0.243 |not send invoice

or proof of cost


































Bid Tabulation

2025-2026 |
ltem Bid: Crushed Rock 3/4"
Unit: Ton
Delivered
Bidder: Product Unit | Delivered [ Undelivered Location Notes

Woodrum Construction Crushed Rock Ton $51.40 NB Grand Saline
Woodrum Construction Crushed Rock Ton $49.80 NB Phalba
Woodrum Construction Crushed Rock Ton $49.00 NB Wills Point
Woodrum Construction Crushed Rock Ton $51.67 NB Ben Wheeler
4M Truck Trailer & Crushed Rock | Ton $58.25 NB Grand Saline
Equipment
M Truck Trailer & Crushed Rock Ton $48.00 NB Phalba
Equipment
4M Truck Trailer & Crushed Rock | Ton $48.00 NB Wills Point
Equipment
M Truck Trailer & Crushed Rock Ton $58.25 NB Ben Wheeler
Equipment
ALTERNATIVE PRODUCT FOR 3/4" CRUSHED ROCK
Woodrum Construction  [Screenings Ton $19.20 NB Grand Saline [* non bidded item
Woodrum Construction  |Screenings Ton $20.27 NB Phalba * non bidded item
Woodrum Construction  [Screenings Ton $17.07 NB Wills Point * non bidded item
Woodrum Construction  [Screenings Ton $21.07 NB Ben Wheeler |* non bidded item













Bid Tabulation

2025-2026 Iltem Bid: Crushed Rock 1" or less
Unit: Ton
Delivered
Bidder: Product Unit Delivered | Undelivered | | ) .o4i5
Price Price

Woodrum Construction | Crushed Rock Ton $44.35 NB Grand Saline
Woodrum Construction | Crushed Rock Ton $42.88 NB Phalba
Woodrum Construction | Crushed Rock Ton $41.82 NB Wills Point
Woodrum Construction | Crushed Rock Ton $44.75 NB Ben Wheeler
4AM Truck Trailer &
Equipment Crushed Rock Ton $ 5350 NB Grand Saline
4AM Truck Trailer &
Equipment Crushed Rock Ton $ 43.50 NB Phalba
4AM Truck Trailer &
Equipment Crushed Rock Ton $ 4350 NB Willspoint
4AM Truck Trailer &
Equipment Crushed Rock Ton $ 5250 NB Ben Wheeler










Bid Tabulation

| 2025-2026 |
Iltem Bid: Crushed Rock 1 3/4"
Unit: Ton

Bidder: Product Unit | Delivered | Undelivered ||_ocation Notes
Woodrum Construction Crushed Rock-Flex Base Ton [$ 33.00 NB Grand Saline
Woodrum Construction Crushed Rock-Flex Base Ton [$ 32.00 NB Phalba
Woodrum Construction Crushed Rock-Flex Base Ton [$ 30.00 NB Wills Point
Woodrum Construction Crushed Rock-Flex Base Ton [$ 36.00 NB Ben Wheeler
Woodrum Construction Crushed Rock-State Base Ton | $ 34.00 NB Grand Saline
Woodrum Construction Crushed Rock-State Base Ton |[$ 34.00 NB Phalba
Woodrum Construction Crushed Rock-State Base Ton [$ 32.00 NB Wills Point
Woodrum Construction Crushed Rock-State Base Ton [$ 38.00 NB Ben Wheeler
4M Truck Trailer & Equipment [Crushed Rock-Flex Base Ton |$ 33.75 NB Grand Saline
4M Truck Trailer & Equipment [Crushed Rock-Flex Base Ton |$ 29.50 NB Phalba
4M Truck Trailer & Equipment [Crushed Rock-Flex Base Ton |$ 29.25 NB Wills Point
4M Truck Trailer & Equipment [Crushed Rock-Flex Base Ton |$ 37.25 NB Ben Wheeler
4AM Truck Trailer & Equipment [Crushed Rock-State Base Ton | $ 36.00 NB Grand Saline
4AM Truck Trailer & Equipment [Crushed Rock-State Base Ton [$ 34.75 NB Phalba
4AM Truck Trailer & Equipment [Crushed Rock-State Base Ton [$ 36.00 NB Wills Point
4AM Truck Trailer & Equipment [Crushed Rock-State Base Ton [$ 38.50 NB Ben Wheeler










Bid Tabulation

2025-2026

Item Bid: Haul Only From Arcosa-Lester Pit, (EImo)/Terrell, Texas

Bidder: Product Unit | Haul Only Price Location
Woodrum Construction Crushed Rock | Ton $ 12.00 Grand Saline/Barn
Woodrum Construction Crushed Rock | Ton $ 12.00 Phalba/Barn
Woodrum Construction Crushed Rock | Ton $ 10.00 Wills Point/Barn
Woodrum Construction Crushed Rock | Ton $ 14.00 Ben Wheeler/Barn Only
4M Truck Trailer & Equipment Crushed Rock | Ton $ 12.50 Grand Saline/Barn
4M Truck Trailer & Equipment Crushed Rock | Ton $ 16.00 Phalba/Barn
4M Truck Trailer & Equipment Crushed Rock | Ton $ 8.00 Wills Point/Barn
4M Truck Trailer & Equipment Crushed Rock | Ton $ 16.00 Ben Wheeler/Barn Only










2025-2026 Bid Tabulation
Item Bid: Road Oil
Unit:  TON
Bidder Product Unit | Delivered | Undelivered Location
Bryan & Bryan Asphalt [Road Oil | Ton | $ 691.00 | $ 665.00 | Precinct #1
Bryan & Bryan Asphalt [Road Oil | Ton | $ 691.00 | $ 665.00 | Precinct #2
Bryan & Bryan Asphalt [Road Oil | Ton | $ 691.00 | $ 665.00 | Precinct #3
Bryan & Bryan Asphalt [Road Oil | Ton | $ 691.00 | $ 665.00 | Precinct #4







Bid Tabulation

2025-2026
Item Bid: Raw/unrefined crude oil
Unit: Barrel

Bidder Product Unit Delivered | Undelivered Location

No Bidders Crude Oil Barrel Precinct #1
Crude Oil Barrel Precinct #2

Crude Oil Barrel Precinct #3

Crude Oil Barrel Precinct #4




Railroad Tank Car Culvert 2025-2026
Bidder Product [Unit Delivered Location
(linear ft)
The Railroad Yard
5' Feet NB County Wide
6'6" Feet NB County Wide
7'3" Feet NB County Wide
7'4" Feet NB County Wide
7'9 Feet NB County Wide
9' Feet 445.00 | County Wide
10' Feet 475.00 | County Wide







Bid Tabulation

2025-2026
Item Bid: Pea Gravel (washed) 3/8"
Unit: Ton
Delivered
Bidder: Delivered Price | Undelivered Price Location

Woodrum Construction $ 39.73 NB Grand Saline
Woodrum Construction $ 37.87 NB Phalba
Woodrum Construction $ 37.60 NB Wills Point
Woodrum Construction $ 39.47 NB Ben Wheeler
4M Truck Trailer & Equipment | $ 40.00 NB Grand Saline
AM Truck Trailer & Equipment | $ 36.50 NB Phalba
4M Truck Trailer & Equipment | $ 40.00 NB Wills Point
AM Truck Trailer & Equipment | $ 40.00 NB Ben Wheeler
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Bid Tabulation

2025-2026

Item Bid: Oil Sand

Item Bid: Type D Hot Mix

Unit: Per Ton
Bidder Undelivered | Grand Saline Phalba Wills Point |Ben Wheeler|Notes
*2 ton minimum for
Texas Materials $ 88.00 | $ 113.00 NB $ 110.00| $ 116.00 [pick up/10ton
minimum for delivery
D & M Contractors $ 99.00 | $ 114.00 116.00 | $ 124.00| $ 114.00
Longview Asphalt $ 92.00| $ 110.00 110.00 | $ 110.00( $ 110.00

Unit: Per Ton
Bidder Undelivered | Grand Saline| Phalba Wills Point |Ben Wheeler
*2 ton minimum for
Texas Materials $ 91.00($ 116.00 NB $ 11400 | $ 119.00 |pick up/10ton
minimum for delivery
Austin Asphalt $ 88.25 | $ 115.25 11358 | $ 10892 $ 119.92
Longview Asphalt $ 113.00( $ 131.00 131.00 | $ 131.00( $ 131.00
*see email-they
Texana-Land-&-Asphalt $——43.00 want to rescind this
bid

Iltem Bid: Type B Hot Mix
Unit: Per Ton
Bidder Undelivered | Grand Saline| Phalba Wills Point |Ben Wheeler
*2 ton minimum for
Texas Materials $ 91.00 | $ 116.00 NB $ 11400 $ 119.00 [pick up/10ton
minimum for delivery
Austin Asphalt $ 8125 $ 108.25 10658 | $ 101.92| $ 112.92
Longview Asphalt $ 113.00( $ 131.00 131.00 | $ 131.00( $ 131.00
*see email-they
Texana-Land-&Asphalt $——42.00 want to rescind this
bid
Item Bid: SSM
Unit: Per Ton
Bidder Undelivered | Grand Saline| Phalba Wills Point |Ben Wheeler
*2 ton minimum for
Texas Materials $ 86.00 | $ 111.00 NB $ 108.00| $ 114.00 |pick up/10ton
minimum for delivery
*see email-they
Fexanatand-&Asphalt $ 3700 want to rescind this

bid




20f 2

Item Bid: ASPPM
Unit: Per Ton
Bidder Undelivered | Grand Saline| Phalba Wills Point |Ben Wheeler
*2 ton minimum for
Texas Materials $  140.00 NB $ 162.00| $ 168.00 |pick up/10ton

minimum for delivery

*see email-they

Texana Land-& Asphalt $——41.00- want to rescind this
bid
Iltem Bid: CPR-4
Unit: Per Ton
Undelivered | Grand Saline Phalba Wills Point [Ben Wheeler
*see email-they did
Vulecan-Construction- $ 7800 | $—17345| $ 16724 | $ 17253 $—172.76-| not mean to bid on
this
*2 ton minimum for
Texas Materials $ 130.00| $ 155.00 NB $ 152.00| $ 158.00 |pick up/10ton
minimum for delivery

Item Bid: Cold Mix

Item Bid: Ultra Tack

Unit: Per Ton
Undelivered | Grand Saline Phalba Wills Point |Ben Wheeler
Bidder

*2 ton minimum for

Texas Materials $ 130.00|$ 155.00 NB $ 152.00 [ $ 158.00 [pick up/10ton
minimum for delivery

Sustainable Pavement $ 60.00 | $ 90.00|{$ 90.00|$ 90.00| $ 90.00

Austin Asphalt $ 153.00($% 180.00($ 17833 | $ 17367 | $ 184.67

Longview Asphalt $ 102.00|$% 120.00|$ 120.00| $ 120.00| $ 120.00

U

nit:

Per Ton

Undelivered

Grand Saline

Phalba

Wills Point

Ben Wheeler

Bidder

No Bids Received






















From: L (O

Sent: F . Ma

To: Nicole Nix

Cc: . _xana Land & Asphalt, Inc.
Subject: 2025 Road & Bridge bid page 27

Good Morning Nicole,

Can| cindourt ~ofVario -cadr erials supply, Located on Pr—- 27 of 65 please.
But please Keep our bid on page 48 of 65 Hot mix road procedure.

Thank you ma’am, sorry | made a mistake.

Lizzy Mohi

Texana Lanc =~ Asphalt, I
406-270-5203












Nicole Nix

From: Nicole Nix

Sent: Tuesday, March 18, 2025 5:01 PM
To: Farrar, Julia

Cc: Catherine Gazda; Lisa Hutcherson
Subject: RE: Van Zandt County

Ok, I will put this email in the bid binders. But we will not be able to put it under the Cold Mix since bids
were sealed and there are no changes allowed once opened other than rescinding bids.

Thank you,

Nicole Nix

nnix@vanzandtcounty.org

Assistant Auditor

Van Zandt County Auditor’s Office

121 East Dallas-Room 102

Canton, TX 75103

Phone #: 903-567-7380

Main Office Ph: 903-567-2171 Ext. 7212
Fax: 903-567-4700

“Love is the energy of life”

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE: This email and any files or attachments transmitted with it should be considered official,
privileged and confidential Van Zandt County communication. The emailis intended solely for the individual or entity
to which it is addressed. If you are not the intended recipient you are hereby notified that reading or any other use of
this message is unauthorized. If you are not the intended recipient please contact the senderimmediately.

From: Farrar, Julia <farrarj@vmcmail.com>
Sent: Tuesday, March 18, 2025 4:58 PM
To: Nicole Nix <nnix@vanzandtcounty.org>
Subject: Re: Van Zandt County

Yes that is correct - they should have been under the cold mix line right below that. My apologies

Julia Farrar

Vulcan Materials Company - SWD

Sales Analyst

SSC: 210-524-4480 / Cell: 210-965-0419


Nicole Nix
Highlight

Nicole Nix
Highlight


On Tue, Mar 18, 2025 at 4:57 PM Nicole Nix <nnix@vanzandtcounty.org> wrote:

So you’re saying prices entered should not have been on the CPR-4?

Thank you,

Nicole Nix

nnix@vanzandtcounty.org

Assistant Auditor

Van Zandt County Auditor’s Office

121 East Dallas-Room 102

Canton, TX 75103

Phone #: 903-567-7380

Main Office Ph: 903-567-2171 Ext. 7212

Fax: 903-567-4700

“Love is the energy of life”

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE: This email and any files or attachments transmitted with it should be considered official,
privileged and confidential Van Zandt County communication. The emailis intended solely for the individual or entity
to which itis addressed. If you are not the intended recipient you are hereby notified that reading or any other use of
this message is unauthorized. If you are not the intended recipient please contact the sender immediately.


Nicole Nix
Highlight


From: Farrar, Julia <farrarj@vmcmail.com>
Sent: Tuesday, March 18, 2025 4:50 PM
To: Nicole Nix <nnix@vanzandtcounty.org>
Subject: Re: Van Zandt County

Oh no I'm so sorry - this should have been under the cold mix right below it that says item 330. We don't
produce a CPR-4. So sorry about that!! Do you need me to send you a revised one?

Julia Farrar
Vulcan Materials Company - SWD
Sales Analyst

SSC: 210-524-4480 / Cell: 210-965-0419

On Tue, Mar 18, 2025 at 4:45 PM Nicole Nix <nnix@vanzandtcounty.org> wrote:

This is for bids y’all submitted regarding CPR-4 on the undelivered. | was trying to give our
commissioners an idea of how far they would need to go to get it.

Thank you,

Nicole Nix

nnix@vanzandtcounty.org

Assistant Auditor

Van Zandt County Auditor’s Office
121 East Dallas-Room 102
Canton, TX 75103

Phone #: 903-567-7380


Nicole Nix
Highlight

Nicole Nix
Highlight


Main Office Ph: 903-567-2171 Ext. 7212

Fax: 903-567-4700

“Love is the energy of life”

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE: This email and any files or attachments transmitted with it should be considered official,
privileged and confidential Van Zandt County communication. The emailis intended solely for the individual or entity
to which itis addressed. If you are not the intended recipient you are hereby notified that reading or any other use of
this message is unauthorized. If you are not the intended recipient please contact the sender immediately.

From: Farrar, Julia <farrarj@vmcmail.com>
Sent: Tuesday, March 18, 2025 4:36 PM
To: Nicole Nix <nnix@vanzandtcounty.org>
Subject: Re: Van Zandt County

What specific materials are you looking for?

Julia Farrar
Vulcan Materials Company - SWD
Sales Analyst

SSC: 210-524-4480 / Cell: 210-965-0419

On Tue, Mar 18, 2025 at 4:34 PM Nicole Nix <nnix@vanzandtcounty.org> wrote:

Hello Julia,


Nicole Nix
Highlight

Nicole Nix
Highlight

Nicole Nix
Highlight


| was curious where your closest office is located as far as picking up materials?

Thank you,

Nicole Nix

nnix@vanzandtcounty.org

Assistant Auditor

Van Zandt County Auditor’s Office

121 East Dallas-Room 102

Canton, TX 75103

Phone #: 903-567-7380

Main Office Ph: 903-567-2171 Ext. 7212

Fax: 903-567-4700

“Love is the energy of life”

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE: This email and any files or attachments transmitted with it should be considered
official, privileged and confidential Van Zandt County communication. The email is intended solely for the
individual or entity to which it is addressed. If you are not the intended recipient you are hereby notified that reading
or any other use of this message is unauthorized. If you are not the intended recipient please contact the sender
immediately.


Nicole Nix
Highlight


Bid Tabulations
| 2025-2026 |
Item Bid: Creosote Lumber
County Wide
Delivered
Bidder 2x6-16' 2x8-16' 2x10-16' | 2x12-16' | 3x12-16' | 4x10-16' |8x10-16'| 6" Piling | 8" Piling | 10" Piling
Item Bid: Creosote Lumber
County Wide
Undelivered
Bidder 2x6-16' 2x8-16' 2x10-16' | 2x12-16' | 3x12-16' | 4x10-16' |8x10-16'| 6" Piling | 6" Piling | 6" Piling
10 Ft 16 Ft 20 Ft

NO BIDS RECEIVED




Bid Tabulation
I I
2025-2026 ltem Bid: 14 Gauge Steel culverts
County Wide
Unit: Each
Delivered
Bidder 12" 15" 18" 21" 24" 36" 48" 60" 72"
*PRICES MAY | *PRICES MAY | *PRICES MAY [ * PRICES MAY |*PRICES MAY | * PRICES MAY | * PRICES MAY *PRICES MAY | * PRICES MAY
Contech Engineered Solutions [VARY VARY VARY VARY VARY VARY VARY VARY VARY
Wilson Culverts $ 1575( % 1969 ($ 2359 |3% 2753 (% 3120 |$ 4688 | % 74.66 | $ 9199 [$ 111.19
Undelivered
Bidder 12" 15" 18" 21" 24" 36" 48" 60" 72"
Contech Engineered Solutions [ $ 23.04$ 2880 |$% 3456 |3$% 4032 |$ 46.08($ 69.12 | $ 9216 |$ 17664 |$ 211.20
Contech-"Undelivered price may vary per quantity of truck load required
Contech- ** Cost per truck load =$460
Wilson Culverts $ 1575($ 1969 ($ 2359 |3$% 2753 ($ 31.20 [ $ 46.88 | $ 74.66 | $ 9199 [$ 111.19










Bid Tabulation
| |
2025-2026 Item Bid: 16 Gauge Steel culverts
County Wide
Unit: Each
Delivered
Bidder 12" 15" 18" 21" 24" 36" 48" 60" 72"
Contech Engineered Solutions | Prices may vary | Prices may vary | Prices may vary| Prices may vary| Prices may vary Prices may vary | Prices may vary Prices may vary Prices may vary
Wilson Culverts $ 1309|$ 1628 |$ 1950 ($ 2273 (% 2599 |$ 3938 | % 6255 | $ 7729 | $ 92.70
Undelivered
Bidder 12" 15" 18" 21" 24" 36" 48" 60" 72"
Contech Engineered Solutions [ $ 1920 |$ 23.04[($ 2880 | $ 3264 |$% 3648 |$ 556893 7296 | $ 12864 | $ 15552
Contech-"Undelivered price may vary per quantity of truck load required
Contech- ** Cost per truck load =$460
Wilson Culverts $ 13.09|$ 16.28|$ 1950|$ 2273|% 2599 |$ 3938 | % 6255 | $ 7729 | $ 92.70










Bid Tabulation

2025-2026 ltem Bid: Seal Coat -AC-5
Chip Rock
Unit: Square Yard
Bidder Pct #1 Pct #2 Pct #3 Pct #4 County Wide
D & M Contractors $ 410 % 410 $ 410 | $ 410 $ 4.10

ltem Bid: Seal Coat AC-5

Pea Gravel (washed)

Unit: Square Yard

Bidder Pct #1 Pct #2 Pct #3 Pct #4 County Wide

D & M Contractors $ 280 | $ 2801 % 280 | $ 280 | $ 2.80

D & M Contractors
Alternative Bid Proposal submitted: see page in binder












Bid Tabulation

2025-2026 Iltem Bid: Seal Coat AC-10
Chip Rock
Unit: Square Yard
Bidder Pct #1 Pct #2 Pct #3 Pct #4 County Wide
D & M Contractors $ 410 | $ 410 | $ 410 | $ 410 | $ 4.10

Iltem Bid: Seal Coat AC-10
Pea Gravel
Unit: Square Yard
Bidder Pct #1 Pct #2 Pct #3 Pct #4 County Wide
D & M Contractors $ 277 | $ 277 | $ 277 | $ 277 | $ 2.77

D & M Contractors

Alternative Bid Proposal submitted: see page in binder












Bid Tabulation

2025-2026 Item Bid: Seal Coat MC-3000
Chip Rock Type B Grade 4
Unit: Square Yard
DELIVERED
Bidder Pct #1 Pct #2 Pct #3 Pct #4 County Wide
D & M Contractors $ 449 | $ 449 | $ 449 | $ 449 | $ 4.49

Item Bid: Seal Coat MC-3000

Pea Gravel Type D Grade 4

Unit: Square Yard
DELIVERED
Bidder Pct #1 Pct #2 Pct #3 Pct #4 County Wide
D & M Contractors $ 410 $ 410 | $ 410 $ 410 | $ 4.10

D & M Contractors

Alternative Bid Proposal submitted: see page in binder













Bid Tabulation

2025-2026 Iltem Bid: Seal Coat CRS-2
Chip Rock
Unit: Square Yard
Bidder Pct #1 Pct #2 Pct #3 Pct #4 County Wide
D & M Contractors $ 422 1% 422 | $ 422 1% 422 1 $ 4.22

Bar None Pavinﬁ $ 4201 % 420 | $ 4201 % 420 | $ 4.20

Iltem Bid: Seal Coat CRS-2
Pea Gravel
Unit: Square Yard
Bidder Pct #1 Pct #2 Pct #3 Pct #4 County Wide
D & M Contractors $ 412 | $ 412 | $ 412 |1 $ 412 | $ 412

D & M Contractors

Alternative Bid Proposal submitted: see page in binder

Bar None Pavini $ 290 | $ 290 | $ 290 | $ 290 | $ 2.90



















Van Zandt County

Bid Tabulation

ltem Bid: EMULSION

2025-2026 GALLON
CRS-2P TXDOT ITEM 300.2, Table 9
Bidder Unit Unit Price Delivered Comments
Ergon Asphalt &
! Gallon $ 3.20| $ 3.40
Emulsions
Cleveland Asphalt 5000 Gal $ 3.00| $ 3.20
4000 Gal $ 3.00| $ 3.25
3000 Gal $ 3001 % 3.33
2000 Gal $ 3.00| $ 3.50
1000 Gal $ 3001 % 4.00
Non Bidded Item:
CSS-1H
E Asphal
rgon Asphalt & Gallon $ 285 | % 3.05 |*non bidded item

Emulsions










Bid Tabulation

2025-2026 Item Bid: Hot Mix Road Procedures
Unit: _Ton

Bidder: Product Unit Pct# 1 GS | Pct# 2 Phalba | Pct#3WP | Pct#4 BW
Texana Land & Asphalt | Option #1 Ton $ 43.00|$ 42.00| $ 3700|$ 41.00
Texana Land & Asphalt | Option #2 Ton $ 43.00|$ 42.00| $ 3700|$ 41.00
Texana Land & Asphalt | Option #3 Ton $ 4100 $ 40.00| $ 36.00| $ 39.00
Area Wide Paving Option #1 Ton $ 218.00 | $ 218.00 | $ 218.00 | $ 218.00
Area Wide Paving Option #2 Ton $ 153.60 | $ 153.60 | $ 14360 | $ 153.60
Area Wide Paving Option #3 Ton $ 35603 3560| $ 3560| % 35.60










Bid Tabulation

2025-2026 | | | ! |
Item Bid: Recycled Crushed Concrete 1" 1/4
Bidder: Product Unit | Delivered | Undelivered Location
Woodrum Construction Recycled Crushed Concrete | Ton $ 37.95 NB Grand Saline/Barn
Woodrum Construction Recycled Crushed Concrete | Ton $ 36.00 NB Phalba/Barn
Woodrum Construction Recycled Crushed Concrete | Ton $ 37.00 NB Wills Point/Barn
Woodrum Construction Recycled Crushed Concrete | Ton $ 38.25 NB Ben Wheeler/Barn Only
4M Truck Trtailer & Equipment Recycled Crushed Concrete | Ton $ 4550 NB Grand Saline/Barn
4M Truck Trtailer & Equipment Recycled Crushed Concrete | Ton $ 4550 NB Phalba/Barn
4M Truck Trtailer & Equipment Recycled Crushed Concrete | Ton $ 4550 NB Wills Point/Barn
4M Truck Trtailer & Equipment Recycled Crushed Concrete | Ton $ 50.50 NB Ben Wheeler/Barn Only
Big City Crushed Concrete Recycled Crushed Concrete | Ton $ 3950 | % 16.00 Grand Saline/Barn
Big City Crushed Concrete Recycled Crushed Concrete | Ton $ 36.00|9% 16.00 Phalba/Barn
Big City Crushed Concrete Recycled Crushed Concrete | Ton $ 3850 % 16.00 Wills Point/Barn
Big City Crushed Concrete Recycled Crushed Concrete | Ton $ 3850 % 16.00 | Ben Wheeler/Barn Only
** Non bidded item {4
Big City Crushed Concrete **Recycled Crushed Asphalt | Ton** | $ 3950 [ $ 16.00 Grand Saline/Barn
Big City Crushed Concrete **Recycled Crushed Asphalt | Ton** | $ 40.00 | $ 16.00 Phalba/Barn
Big City Crushed Concrete **Recycled Crushed Asphalt | Ton** | $ 3850 [ $ 16.00 Wills Point/Barn
Big City Crushed Concrete **Recycled Crushed Asphalt | Ton** | $ 3850 | $ 16.00 | Ben Wheeler/Barn Only













Bid Tabulation

2025-2026 |
Iltem Bid: Recycled Crushed Concrete 1" 3/4
Bidder: Product Unit | Delivered | Undelivered Location
Woodrum Construction Recycled Crushed Concrete | Ton $ 37.95 NB Grand Saline/Barn
Woodrum Construction Recycled Crushed Concrete | Ton $ 36.00 NB Phalba/Barn
Woodrum Construction Recycled Crushed Concrete | Ton $ 37.00 NB Wills Point/Barn
Woodrum Construction Recycled Crushed Concrete | Ton $ 38.25 NB Ben Wheeler/Barn Only
4M Truck Trailer & Equipment | Recycled Crushed Concrete | Ton $ 45.50 NB Grand Saline/Barn
4M Truck Trailer & Equipment | Recycled Crushed Concrete | Ton $ 45.50 NB Phalba/Barn
4M Truck Trailer & Equipment | Recycled Crushed Concrete | Ton $ 45.50 NB Wills Point/Barn
4M Truck Trailer & Equipment | Recycled Crushed Concrete | Ton $ 50.50 NB Ben Wheeler/Barn Only










Bid Tabulation

| 2025-2026 |

Item Bid: RECYCLED UNUSED ASPHALT SHINGLE PAVEMENT-DELIVERED

Unit: per Mile

Bidder: Product Unit | Delivered [Location

Recycled Unused
No bidders Asphalt Shingle Mile Grand Saline
Pavement

Recycled Unused
Asphalt Shingle Mile Phalba
Pavement

Recycled Unused
Asphalt Shingle Mile Wills Point
Pavement

Recycled Unused
Asphalt Shingle Mile Ben Wheeler
Pavement




Bid Tabulation

| 2025-2026 |
Item Bid: RECYCLED UNUSED ASPHALT SHINGLE PAVEMENT-UNDELIVERED
Unit: Yard
Bidder: Product Unit | Undelivered |Location
All Pcts (Pct. 1/Grand
Recycled Unused .
. : Saline, Pct. 2/Phalba,
Sustainable Pavement Asphalt Shingle Yard | $ 30.00 Pit'_n;Wiﬁs Poima Pit_
Pavement 4/Ben Wheeler
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